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About the Institution 
     Sri Sarada College for Women, Tirunelveli was started in the year 1986 to cater the 
educational needs of the women of Southern districts of Tamilnadu.  It is an un-aided 
higher education institution recognised and included under sections 2(f) & 12(B) of 
University Grants Commission (UGC) reaccredited with ‘A’ grade by NAAC and conferred 
with Autonomous status since 2019-20. It is affiliated to Manonmaniam Sundaranar 
University, Tirunelveli. The educational vision and mission of the college are reflected in 
the motto of the college.  "The Harmonious Development of the Hand, the Heart and the 
Head" of the student is the vision of our Revered founder Srimath Swami 
Chidbhavananda. His great desire was that, the girls who enter the portals of this Temple 
of Learning should leave it as "Nirai Nangaiyar"-'the perfect women'. Character building 
and culture inculcation are the basis upon which the super structure of modern 
education is raised here.  The college offers 11 UG Programmes, 7 PG Programmes, 4 
MPhil., Programmes with 2 Research centres leading to Ph.D., in Computer Science and 
Commerce.  The institution is having AICTE – MCA. 

About the Department 
       The Department of Sanskrit offers Part I –Sanskrit to the Under Graduate Students. 
Sanskrit is the oldest language of the world. Since Sanskrit literature has come down to us 
through oral tradition called the Shruti Parampara, the maximum number of works are in 
poetry only. Starting from the Rigveda, the earliest document in world literature, there is 
a continuous flow of Sanskrit works in poetry. To enrich Sanskrit knowledge to our 
students, the department also offers MHRD sponsored Diploma in Sanskrit under 
Rashtriya Sanskrit Sansthan, the Central Sanskrit University.  

About Bharatiya Bhasha Samiti  
 

        Bharatiya Bhasha Samiti is a High-Powered Committee for the Promotion of Indian 
Languages. It has been constituted by the Ministry of Education, Government of India in 
2021. The mandate of this committee would be to explore and recommend pathways for 
the holistic and multidisciplinary growth of Indian languages as envisaged in the National 
Education Policy 2020. It has also been entrusted to advise the Ministry on all matters 
pertaining to the revitalization of existing language teaching and research and its 
extension in various institutions in the country. 

About the Vyakhyanamala 
 

        Jagadguru Shresh Shankarcharya is a great spiritual heritage to all of us. He devoted 
his entire life to clarify the geographical, scientific and spiritual aspects of India. He used 
his utmost skill in all directions in this aspect and hoisted the flag everywhere. In his 
writings, he synthesised the Advaita Vedanta teachings of his time and offered a 
harmonising reading of the sastras with liberating knowledge of the self at its core. To 
import the knowledge of the great scholar and guru in the young minds, this 
Vyakhyanamala is sponsored by Bharatiya Bhasha Samiti. It is a great opportunity to the 
young generation to know about the Great Guru. 
 



Bus Route:  7C, 16D, 32C, 16H, 16B, 150 (From Tirunelveli New Bus Stand to        

                         Thoothukudi)   

Contact Numbers:  8838065448, 6379524447 

*Lunch and Refreshment will be provided 
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